
Golf Etiquette
•	 Keep golf cars on designated paths to help 

preserve the course and its beauty.

•	 Use a ball mark repair tool to gently fix any 
ball marks, smoothing them over with your 
putter or foot, ensuring the greens remain in 
excellent condition.

•	 After leaving a bunker, take a moment to 
smooth over any holes or footprints with the 
provided rake, leaving the sand pristine for the 
next player.

•	 Be proactive in maintaining the course 
by filling divots and repairing ball marks, 
contributing to a better experience for all 
golfers.

•	 Be mindful of your surroundings by staying 
quiet and out of view when golfers are 
preparing to hit. Keep your phone off and 
remain aware of others’ swings. 

•	 Help maintain a smooth pace of play so 
everyone can enjoy their round without delays.

•	 Respect your fellow golfers by standing in 
a place where you won’t distract them, and 
always remain still while they hit.

•	 If you hit a ball in the direction of another 
player, always shout “FORE!” to alert others 
and keep the game safe.

•	 Once everyone has finished putting, make 
your way to the next tee promptly, keeping the 
game flowing smoothly.

•	 Sand your divots to help the turf recover and 
keep the course in top shape for future rounds.

•	 Always park golf cars with all four wheels on 
the cart path near tee boxes and greens to 
protect the turf, and use the path when moving 
between shots to avoid damaging the fairway.
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For more information related to Executive Golf, please visit:
 www.districtgov.org/golf/maintenance/


